
INDIAN RIVER MOSQUITO CONTROL DISTRICT 
Financial Report 

for 
November  1 –  November 30, 2023 

I. Income   $2,003,037.00 

State Funds    $195.00 

    $2,003,232.00 

II. Disbursements

a. Local Funds (14962-15017 & dd13877-dd13945)  $592,873.93 

b. State Funds  $0.00____    

c. Total Disbursements -$592,873.93 

d. Net   $1,410,358.07 

III. Change in cash position from last month   $1,417,569.88 

IV. Bank balance (all accounts)   $4,899,838.48 

a. Less reserves and contingency  -$2,255,352.53 

V. Total available cash    $2,644,485.95 































JANICE BRODA, COMMISSIONER 
MATT ERPENBECK, COMMISSIONER 
ANNA KIRKLAND, COMMISSIONER 
SHERRY BURROUGHS, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR  

MEMORANDUM 

Date: December 12, 2023 

To: Board of Commissioners 

From: Sherry Burroughs, Executive Director & Lisa Ridley, Finance Director  

Subject: Authorization for the Disposal of Surplus Property  
 

This request is being submitted for approval to surplus property items that have been identified 
as obsolete, damaged, and unusable. The items listed below have accumulated over time and 
the value of this property is insufficient to defray the cost of  arranging sale at a public auction.  
Staff are recommending scrap sale of surplus metal items.   

Items included for disposition are listed below: 

• Vehicle Replacement Parts, Miscellaneous Tools  
• Flap Gates 
• Culvert Saddles  
• (4) Culverts Vero Shores (Not Pictured)   
• Ice Machine  
• Flow Valves  

Photos have been included as supporting documentation for this request.  
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Ice Machine                                                 Flap Gates, Culvert Saddles, Flow Valves, Misc. Tools  

 

      

Miscellaneous Scrap                                                Vehicle Replacement Parts, Misc. Tools  

 



JANICE BRODA, COMMISSIONER 
MATT ERPENBECK, COMMISSIONER 
ANNA KIRKLAND, COMMISSIONER 
SHERRY BURROUGHS, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR  

MEMORANDUM 

  

Date: December 12, 2023 

To: Board of Commissioners 

From: Sherry Burroughs, Executive Director & Lisa Ridley, Finance Director    

Subject: Calendar Year 2024 Chemical Bid   

The attached bid comparison document has been prepared by the fiscal section, with staff 
recommendations for product award as follows: 

LARVACIDE 

Single Brood Spinosad  
 Censor (Clarke) 

Single Brood Bacillus Thuringeinsis Israelensis (BTI) 

 Vectobac GS (Adapco Azelis) 

Single Brood Methoprene 
 Altosid SBGII  (Veseris) 

Residual BTI  

 Fourstar BTI CRG, Fourstar MBG, Fourstar 180 Day (Clarke) 

Residual Methoprene 
 Altosid P35 (Clarke)  (Veseris) 
 Altosid Pellets (Clarke) (Veseris) 
 Altosid XRG (Clarke) (Veseris) 
 Altosid XRG Ultra (Clarke)  (Veseris) 
 Altosid XR Briquets,  Altosid 30day Briq.(Clarke) (Veseris) 
 Duplex – G (Clarke) (Veseris)  
 MetaLarv XRP (Adapco Azelis)  
 MetaLarv S-PT (Adapco Azelis) 

Residual Spinosad  
 Natular G30 (Clarke) 
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Spinosad Tablets  
 Natular XRT, DT Tablets (Clarke) 

BTI Liquid  

 Aquabac XT (Veseris) 

Spinosad Liquid  
 Natular SC (Clarke) 

Methoprene Liquid 
 Altosid SR-20, SR-5 Concentrate (Clarke)  (Veseris) 

ADULTICIDE  

 Sumethrin Duet  (Clarke) 
 Permethrin Kontrol 30-30 (Veseris) 
 Deltamethrin (No-Award) 

 



January 2024 - December 2024 Indian River Mosquito Control District
Reference Number 335035

Larvicide and Adulticide Chemicals 

Item UOM Description
Product 
Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price Award Vendor 

1) Pounds Single Brood Spinosad Censor
$4.06/lb      
$3.81/lb

40lb/Bag          
1000lb/Supersack

$162.40        
$3,810.00

$162.40        
$3,810.00 Clarke

1) Continued/See Above Natular G
$9.07/lb        
$8.85/lb

40lb/Bag          
1000lb Supersack

$362.80           
$8,850.00

$362.80           
$8,850.00 Clarke

1) Single Brood Spinosad No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 
1) Single Brood Spinosad No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Bid Target
1) Single Brood Spinosad No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Veseris
2) Pounds Single Brood Bacillus Thuringeinsis Israelensis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Clarke

2) Single Brood Bacillus Thuringeinsis Israelensis Vectobac GS
$1.67/lb      $1.67/lb         

$1.61/lb

40/lb Bag                         
(1-23)1200lb SuperSack   
(24)1200lb Supersack

$66.80/Bag     
$2,004/Supersack     

$1,932/Supersack*Free

$66.80/Bag     
$2,004/Supersack     

$1,932/Supersack*Free Adapco 

2) Single Brood Bacillus Thuringeinsis Israelensis
Summit BTI 

Granules 
$1.59/lb         
$1.52/lb

40 lb Bags
1-19 40lb Bags

20+ Palletts
$63.60/Bag             
$60.80/Bag Invalid Bid Target

2) Continued/See Above 
Summit BTI 

Granules
$1.59/lb         
$1.52/lb

1000lb Supersack        
1-19 Supersacks
20+ Supersacks

$1,590           
$1,520 Invalid Bid Target

2) Single Brood Bacillus Thuringeinsis Israelensis Aquabac 200G

$1.68/lb       
$1.68/lb         
$1.62/ lb

40lb/Bag        
1,200lb Supersack    
(24) 1,200lb Supersack

$67.20/Bag   
$2,016/Supersack      
$1,944/Supersack Veseris

3) Pounds Single Brood Methoprene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Clarke
3) Single Brood Methoprene No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 

3) Single Brood Methoprene Astosid SBGII
$3.63/lb             
$3.63/lb

40lb Bags              
1,000lb Tote                       

$145.20       
$3,630.00 Invalid Bid Target

3) Single Brood Methoprene Altosid SBG II
$145.20            

$3,630.00
40lb Bag         

1,000lb Bag
$145.20            

$3,630.00
$145.20            

$3,630.00 Veseris
4) Pounds Residual BTI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 
4) Residual BTI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Veseris
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Item UOM Description
Product 
Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price Award Vendor 

4) Residual BTI
Fourstar BTI 

CRG
$14.76/lb      
$14.74/lb

35lb Bag         
1,000lb Bags

$516.60           
$14,740.00

$516.60           
$14,740.00 Clarke

4) Continued/See Above Fourstar MBG $11.15/lb     1,000lb Bags $11,150.00 $11,150.00 Clarke

4) Continued/See Above
Fourstar 180 

Day $877.68 200/Case   $877.68 $877.68 Clarke

5) Pounds Residual Methoprene Altosid P35
$20.05/lb      
$19.60/lb

40lb/Bag                       
1 or2,000lb/Tote

$802.00        
$39,200.00

$802.00        
$39,200.00    
Dual Award Clarke

5) Continued/See Above Altosid XR-G
$10.05/lb      
$9.95/lb

40lb/Bag          
1,000lb/Tote

$402.00        
$9,950.00

$402.00        
$9,950.00     Dual 

Award Clarke

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid XR-G 

Ultra
$12.85/lb      
$12.73/lb

40lb/Bag          
1,000lb/Bag

$514.00        
$12,730.00

$514.00        
$12,730.00      
Dual Award Clarke

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid 
Pellets

$28.50/lb      
$25.63/lb

44lb/Case      
2,000lb/Tote

$1,254.00        
$51,260.00

$1,254.00        
$51,260.00      
Dual Award Clarke

5) Continued/See Above Duplex-G
$16.00/lb      
$15.70/lb

40lb/Bag      
2,000lb/Tote

$640.00        
$31,400.00

$640.00        
$31,400.00      
Dual Award Clarke

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid XR 
Briquets $842.60/Case 220/Case $842.60/Case

$842.60/Case      
Dual Award Clarke

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid 30 Day 

Briquets $536.00/Case 400/Case $536.00/Case
$536.00/Case      
Dual Award Clarke

5) Pounds Residual Methoprene Metalarv XRP
$490/Case    

$1,936/Case
200/Case      
800/Case

$490/Case    
$1,936/Case

$490/Case    
$1,936/Case Adapco 

5) Continued/See Above MetaLarv S-PT $30.58/lb
40lb/Bag      

1000lb/Tote
$1,223.20     

$30,580.00
$1,223.20     

$30,580.00 Adapco 
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Item UOM Description
Product 
Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price Award Vendor 

5) Residual Methoprene

Altosid XR 
Briquets                  

Altosid XR 
Slim Ingot      

Altosid 30Day 
Briq.

$842.60/Case       
$842.60/Case        
$536.00/Case

220 Briquets         
220 Briquets          
400 Briquets

$842.60/Case       
$842.60/Case        
$536.00/Case Invalid Bid Target

5) Continued/See Above 
Altosid 
Pellets

$28.50/lb      
$25.63/lb

44lb Case              
2,000lb Tote                        

$1,254.00/Case         
$51,260.00/Tote Invalid Bid Target

5) Continued/See Above 
Altosid WSP 

Pellets $792.00/Case 800Pouch/Case $792.00/Case Invalid Bid Target

5) Continued/See Above Altosid P35
$20.05/lb           
$19.60/lb

40lb Bag                         
2,000lb Tote

$802.00/Bag        
$39,200.00/Tote Invalid Bid Target

5) Continued/See Above Altosid XR-G
$10.05/lb            
$9.95/lb

40lb Bag         
1,000lb Bag

$402.00/Bag       
$9,950.00/Bag Invalid Bid Target

5) Continued/See Above 
Altosid XR-G 

Ultra
$12.85/lb            
$12.73/lb

40lb Bag         
1,000lb Tote

$514.00/Bag       
$12,730.00/Tote Invalid Bid Target

5) Continued/See Above Duplex-G
$16.00/lb            
$15.70/lb

40lb Bag         
2,000lb Tote

$640.00/Bag       
$31,400.00/Tote Invalid Bid Target

5) Residual Methoprene Duplex-G
$640.00/Bag       
$31,400/Tote

40lb Bag         
2,000lb Tote

$640.00/Bag       
$31,400/Tote

$640.00/Bag       
$31,400/Tote      
Dual Award Veseris

5) Continued/See Above Altosid P35

$802.00/Bag        
$39,200/Tote         

$19,600.00/Bulk Bag

40lb Bag                 
2,000lb Tote         

1,000 Bulk Bag

$802.00/Bag        
$39,200/Tote         

$19,600.00/Bulk Bag

$802.00/Bag        
$39,200/Tote         

$19,600.00/Bulk Bag  Dual 
Award Veseris

5) Continued/See Above Altosid XRG
$402.00/Bag       

$9,950.00/Bag
40lb Bag         

1,000lb Bag
$402.00/Bag       

$9,950.00/Bag

$402.00/Bag       
$9,950.00/Bag  

Dual Award Veseris
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Item UOM Description
Product 
Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price Award Vendor 

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid XRG 

Ultra
$514.00/Bag       

$12,730.00/Bag
40lb Bag         

1,000lb Bag
$514.00/Bag       

$12,730.00/Bag

$514.00/Bag       
$12,730.00/Bag      

Dual Award Veseris

5) Continued/See Above Altosid Pellets $28.50/lb         44lb Case                                     $1,254.00 
$1,254.00                  

Dual Award Veseris

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid XR 
Briquets    $842.60 220/Case $842.60

$842.60                
Dual Award Veseris

5) Continued/See Above
Altosid 30day 

Briquets $536.00/Case 400/Case $536.00/Case
$536.00/Case      
Dual Award Veseris

6) Pounds Residual Spinosad Natular G30
$21.24/lb        
$21.04/lb

40lb/Bag         
1,000lb/Tote

$849.60          
$21,040.00

$849.60          
$21,040.00 Clarke

6) Continued/See Above
Natular G30 

WSP $584.85/Case 10 Pack/50X10g $584.85/Case $584.85/Case Clarke
6) Residual Spinosad No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 
6) Residual Spinosad No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Bid Target
6) Residual Spinosad No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Veseris

7) Tablets Spinosad Tablets  
Natular XRT 

Tablets $1,298.33/Case 220 Tabs/Case $1,298.33/Case $1,298.33/Case Clarke

7) Continued/See Above
Natular DT 

Tablets $379.41/Case 600/Tablets $379.41/Case $379.41/Case Clarke
8) Gallons Bacillus Thuringiensis Israelensis (Liquid) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Clarke

8) Bacillus Thuringiensis Israelensis (Liquid)
Vectobac 

12AS $38.06/Gallon

2X2.5Gallon Case      
30/Gallon                 
264 Gallon

$190.30      
$1,141.80       

$10,047.84 Adapco 
8) Bacillus Thuringiensis Israelensis (Liquid) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Bid Target

8) Bacillus Thuringiensis Israelensis (Liquid) Aquabac XT $34.80/Gallon

2X2.5 Galllon            
30/Gallon             

250/Gallon

$174.00        
$1,044.00      
$8,700.00

$174.00        
$1,044.00      
$8,700.00 Veseris
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Item UOM Description
Product 
Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price Award Vendor 

9) Gallons Spinosad (Liquid) Natular SC $1,398.41/Gallon 2.5 Gallon Jug $3,496.03 $3,496.03 Clarke
9) Spinosad (Liquid) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 
9) Spinosad (Liquid) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Bid Target

10) Gallons Methoprene (Liquid) Altosid SR-5 $294.50/Gallon 4X1 Gallon/Case $1,178.00
$1,178             

Dual Award Clarke

10) Methoprene (Liquid) Altosid SR-20 $1,048.20/Gallon (2)2.5Gallon/Case $5,241.00/Case
$5,241.00/Case      

Dual Award Clarke
10) Methoprene (Liquid) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 

10) Methoprene (Liquid)
Altosid SR-20 

Con.     $1,048.20/Gallon 5 Gallon/Case              $5,241/Case Invalid Bid Target
10) Methoprene (Liquid) Altosid SR-5 $294.50/Gallon 4X1 Gallon/Case $1,178.00 Invalid Bid Target

10) Methoprene (Liquid) Altosid SR-20 $1,048.20/Gallon 2X2.5Gallon Case $5,241.00 
$5,241.00                   

Dual Award Veseris

10) Continued See Above Altosid SR-5 $294.50/Gallon 4X1 Gallon/Case $1,178.00
$1,178.00          

Dual Award Veseris

1 Gallons Sumethrin 10% PBO 10% Duet

$273.40         
$266.97        
$255.55        
$254.32

2.5Gallon         
30/Gallon      
55/Gallon      
275/Tote

$683.50     
$8,009.10     

$14,055.25     
$69,938.00

$683.50     
$8,009.10     

$14,055.25     
$69,938.00 Clarke

1 Sumethrin 10% PBO 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 
1 Sumethrin 10% PBO 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Bid Target
1 Sumethrin 10% PBO 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Veseris

2 Gallons Permethrin 30% PBO 30% Perm-X 30+30

$134.40       
$128.33      
$128.33

(2)2.5/Gallon         
30/Gallon       

275Gallon/Tote

$672.00          
$3,849.90     

$35,290.75 Clarke

2 Permethrin 30% PBO 30%
PermaSease 

30-30 $99.98/Gallon

(2)2.5Gallon/Case     
30 Gallon/Drum     
275/Gallon Tote

$499.90/Case       
$2,999.40/Drum         
$27,494.50/Tote Adapco 
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Item UOM Description
Product 
Name Unit Price Container Size Total Price Award Vendor 

2 Permethrin 30% PBO 30%
Permanone 30-

30 $62.50 Gallon $62.50 Invalid Bid Target

2 Permethrin 30% PBO 30% Kontrol 30-30 $80.72/Gallon

275/Gallon  Tote     
55/Gallon Drums        
30/Gallon Drums      

$22,198.00      
$4,439.60      
$2,421.60

$22,198.00      
$4,439.60      
$2,421.60 Veseris

3 Gallons Deltamethrin 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Clarke
3 Deltamethrin 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Adapco 

3 Deltamethrin 2%
DeltaGard / 
Imperium

$249                $242                  
$240

5 Gallons                
30 Gallon Drum            

250 Gallon Totes

$1,245.00
$7,260.00           

$60,000.00 Invalid Bid Target
3 Deltamethrin 2% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A Veseris
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